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Abstract

Fishing conditions on the North Coast of Java are known to experience over�shing; This then has an impact on low
�sheries productivity which then triggers con�icts between �shermen, increases the poverty of �shermen, and threatens
the food security of coastal communities whose livelihoods are very dependent on �sh resources in the sea. Therefore,
this study examines potential con�icts among small-scale �shermen in the use of �sh resources and its impact on food
security also the resolution of these con�icts. The method used is a qualitative approach supported by quantitative data.
Data analysis refers to the structural-functional theory and con�ict theory. The study results show that con�icts for
livelihood mostly occur among small-scale �shermen. The forms of con�ict that small-scale �shermen often perpetrate
are vandalism and petty theft, with protests or sanctions that are given only to be silenced because coastal �shermen on
North coast of Java still uphold Javanese culture, which prefers to live in peace and harmony. Some of the actions taken
to secure food when con�ict inevitably occurs are diversifying livelihoods, utilizing locally available food sources,
maintaining applicable Javanese norms and customs as well as high utilization of social capital among small-scale
�shermen. Con�ict resolution among small-scale �shermen is usually carried out by simply being silent and forgotten
over time or through deliberations mediated through religious leaders, rich �shermen (upper layer), and wise old
�shermen. The dynamics of con�icts that occur among small-scale �shermen do not appear much because the existing
con�icts are more latent.
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1. Introduction
Rapid population growth, increased demand for food, economic development, and technological advances have resulted
in Indonesia's exploitation of �shery resources. Most of the capture �sheries in Indonesia have been over-exploited
(Satria and Matsuda, 2004; Stobutzki, Silvestre, and Garces, 2006; Heazle and Butcher, 2007). Coupled with efforts to
increase Indonesian �shery catches, driving �sh populations to decline, the absence of sustainability and destructive
�shing practices can reduce Indonesia's overall productivity and resilience (Lungren et al., 2006).

A sustained decline in �sh catches, leading to a decline in income, leads to a decline in overall living standards and
poverty in coastal communities. This will result in increased insecurity and social, economic, and political con�ict,
unsustainable resource use, or "resource wars" (Pomeroy et al., 2007).

Adhuri and Visser (2007) and Adhuri (2013) have identi�ed several types of �sheries con�icts. Con�icts occur over
unclear or confused claims to marine areas due to unclear tenure. The second source of con�ict involves concerns over
social justice and resource distribution due to inequitable marine resource management regimes. The third source of
con�ict is technology due to the modernization of technology introduced to an area and threatens local �shermen's
catch, which then triggers con�ict. Muawanah, et. al., (2012) have identi�ed other sources of �sheries con�ict, including
population increase, often as a result of in-migration, resulting in increased competition for resources; competition for
�shing grounds between small-scale and commercial vessels, i.e. larger commercial vessels �shing in the 12-mile
coastal area designated for small-scale �sheries; emerging con�icts between local and migrant �shers; over�shing
issues in many parts of Indonesia such as Sumatra, Sunda, and Java seas. Satria & Matsuda (2004) stated that the main
cause of such fragility is that there are multi-level con�icts among traditional �shers, tourism entrepreneurs, the central
government (Agency for Natural Conservation), and the local government. The community level con�ict (between
traditional �shers and tourism) is resolved by themselves through a compensation mechanism, while the supra
community level- con�icts (vertical con�icts of property rights and authority) still occur. Kurniasari et al. (2017) mention
that con�ict also has a positive impact, namely increasing awareness of green mussel cultivators and processors to
form groups, accelerating the resolution of issues that have developed so far, and leading to alliances between
interested groups.

In addition, this study took place in Java, where Sulistiyono and Rochwulaningsih (2013) also said that it was interesting
that Java has various maritime and feudalistic inland cultures. Many people may assume that the culture that developed
in the Indonesian archipelago must be maritime, that is, a culture that was born and developed in response to the
potential of the sea. But, on the island of Java, there is not only a maritime culture but also a feudalistic agrarian culture.
Even the effect of feudalistic culture, the spirit of feudalism, especially Javanese culture, still lasts today.

The socio-cultural aspects of �shermen's lives are also an important source of con�ict. Small-scale �shers lack stable
incomes, health insurance, and social security. These issues complicate the very poor character of small-scale �shers
and can easily escalate into major con�icts over small issues. Ariando and Arunotai (2022) mentioned that �shermen
lack assets and access, making them marginalized by area-based development. This issue is also a driver of cultural
discrimination that has the potential to cause socio-cultural con�icts. Considers these marginalized communities, this
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paper provides an alternative view and analysis of con�icts and the effect on food security among small-scale �shers on
the North coast of Java.

2. Research Methodology
This study was carried out primarily through a qualitative approach supported by quantitative data with a case study
strategy in one of the areas on the North Coast of Java, conducted from November 2019 to March 2020. Muarareja
village located in Tegal City, directly borders the North Sea of Java (see Figure 1). Data sources include primary data and
secondary data, through 1) �eld observations; 2) documentation; 3) interviews (primary data obtained through structured
interviews with questionnaires and interview guides for informants); 4) Focus Group Discussion (FGD) with crew
members and also ship owners (Issues discussed in this FGD are con�icts that often occur between �shermen owners
and crew members, forms of con�ict, impacts and resolution of con�icts that have been carried out or encountered in
the area north coast of Java); 5) secondary data collection includes, among other things, ship owner data reports, catch
results, regional statistical reports (demographics and sub-district monographs) and other relevant documents. , taking
data sources with certain considerations, namely based on the con�ict actors that occurred, namely between ship
owners, between crew members and ship owners, and also between crew members within the scope of small-scale
�shermen. So, 14 informants were divided into 2 groups, namely 7 informants from the ship owner and 7 informants
from the crew and the unit of analysis was the individual. Thus, the 14 informants were considered su�cient to represent
the conditions of social con�ict and food security that occurred between small-scale leans on the North Coast of Java
and the case on Muarareja Beach.The criteria for small-scale �shermen are �shermen with boat sizes below 10GT.
Meanwhile, the respondents used as samples in the research were 70 small-scale �shing households in a survey using
an incidental random sampling technique, meaning randomly and depending on the �shermen who could be found. This
is done because of his livelihood as a �sherman who cannot always be found at home because he is at sea. The
respondents used were small-scale �shermen in Muarareja Village who were registered with TPI Muarareja with less
than 150 �shermens.

Fig 1. Map of the research location in Muarareja village, Tegal, North Coast of Java. (Source: Google Maps)
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Participatory research approach that is conducted in a participatory, democratic manner. The foundational premise of
participatory research methods is the value placed on genuine and meaningful participation – methods that offer “the
ability to speak up, to participate, to experience oneself and be experienced as a person with the right to express yourself
and to have the expression valued by others” (Abma et al. 2019).

We collected data from small-scale shing households using survey questionnaires designed to capture data on small-
scale �sheries con�ict to the food insecurity experiences. Questionnaires were pre-tested through scoping visits and
modied where necessary before actual data collection (e.g., we modied the framing of some ambiguous questions to
better target the study's goal). Questionnaires included socio-demographic and institutional characteristics, livelihood
income strategies, social and political networks, household income sources and expenditure, livelihood assets, and food
security. Perceptions on conict event, food security, and environmental degradation concerns. All respondents gave
verbal consent to participate in the study before they were allowed to complete the questionnaires.

In addition, to obtain good information, key informant interviews were conducted to gain a better understanding of
frequent con�icts among small-scale �shers. The issues discussed in these interviews are the con�icts that often occur
among owner and crew �shermen, the form of con�ict, the impact, and the con�ict resolution that has been done or
encountered on the north coast of Java. After all data and information are collected, qualitative data analysis is
conducted through three stages: data reduction, data presentation, and veri�cation (Creswell, 2009), and for quantitative
data is analyzed using descriptive statistical analysis.

3.1 Factors/causes of Fishermen con�lict

Among the 70 coastal �shers who provided information about the causes of con�ict among small-scale �shers to the
survey, only 3 �shers, said that it was caused by �shing line breaches (�shing gear damage). The remaining 67
respondents all wrote about some form of adjacent �shing ground, social jealousy, the increasing number of �shers, the
use of different �shing gear, and decreasing catches (see Figure 1). Here, it is important to note that in coastal
community life, con�ict is an inherent social turmoil. The variety, patterns, sources, and forms of con�ict will certainly be
different, local, and speci�c. Small �shermen in this study refer to Kinseng (2014), namely small �shermen who work
alone or with one to three laborers. In this study, con�ict issues that occurred among small-scale �shermen on the north
coast of Java were identi�ed as related to the utilization of regional space, demographics, and livelihoods, including
adjacent �shing areas, social jealousy, the use of different �shing gear, violation of �shing lines, an increase in the
number of �shermen, and less catch. Some of these things are strongly suspected as triggers of con�icts among local
small-scale �shers in Tegal. Perceived information on the source of con�ict is presented in Figure 2.
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Fig 2. Informants' perceptions of the causes of con�ict among small-scale �shers

The spatial utilization of �shing areas is the biggest driver of �shery con�ict among �shermen on the north coast of
Java, especially in Tegal. As many as 36% of respondents stated that neighboring �shing areas often triggered con�ict
(Figure 2). In addition, issues related to livelihood and demography are often the drivers of social con�ict among
�shermen in Tegal. According to the informants, these con�icts often occur due to social jealousy, differences in the use
of �shing gear, and the increasing number of people who earn a living as �shermen (Figure 2).

According to the informants, the increasing number of �shermen triggered social jealousy. Social jealousy happens
because the more �shermen there are, the more boats with different size ranges and the more diverse �shing gear.
Hence, the difference in the ability to own and access livelihood capital is the root of social jealousy among small-scale
�shermen. Fishermen, especially island and small-scale �shermen, can own and access low livelihood capital (Nissa et.
al., 2019; Suadi et al., 2021, 2022).

In addition to climate change, the increase in the number of �shers, boats, and �shing gear owned also impacts the
decline in �sh populations in the �shing area. Thus, this research can also be in line with the research of Mendenhall et
al., (2020) and Villegas et al., (2021) which also state that the main drivers of �sheries con�icts are strategic �shing
locations and declining �sh populations.

3.2 Actions and Con�lict Types of small-scale Fishers

The scarcity of �sheries resources triggered by increased �shing effort, over�shing, coastal habitat modi�cation, and
competition among co-users, coupled with demographic population growth that drives the increase in �shers, has
become a global concern. It is widely agreed that excess �shing capacity is a consequence of increased con�ict and
social unrest affecting regional security and environmental sustainability (Pomeroy et al., 2016).
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The increasing incidence of inter-�sher competition and con�ict arising from coastal �sheries poses several threats to
small-scale �shers. Forms of threats from actions between small-scale �shers in con�ict on the north coast of Java,
especially Tegal, include the destruction of �shing gear, fuel theft, �shing gear, and �shing equipment (Figure 3).

Fig 3. Percentage of frequent forms of con�ict among small-scale �shing households in Muarareja village, tegal, North Coast of Java

The con�ict between �shermen in Tegal was more triggered due to feelings of jealousy due to differences in catches
obtained than there was an argument between �shermen. In addition, con�ict triggers also occur due to the struggle for
�shing gear areas close to each other between small �shermen in Tegal, often providing threats in the form of theft of
�shing gear or destruction of �shing gear. In contrast to the con�icts of �shermen in previous studies, it is often revealed
that the threat of con�icts that occur in the form of piracy, kidnapping crew members, and piracy (Bueger et. al., 2011;
Liss, 2013). Con�icts that occur among small-scale �shers on the north coast of Java are more involved in petty theft
from other �shing boats that are considered as competitors, theft of fuel that will be used for �shing, theft of �shing
gear, destruction of �shing gear, and most often occur is �ghting between �shermen intending to vent grudges and
reduce competitors at sea.

Based on the formation of a con�ict group, Kinseng (2007) divides con�icts among �shermen (internal con�icts) into
three categories, namely: 1) class con�ict is a con�ict that occurs between different classes of �shermen, for example,
between laborers and owners or between the class of small �shermen and large-capitalist �shermen. 2) Identity con�ict
is a con�ict that occurs between �shermen groups based on primordial identities such as ethnicity and regional origin
often known as local versus migrant. In addition, religion can also be used as the basis for forming this primordial
con�ict group, and the last is 3) �shing gear con�ict is a con�ict that occurs between �shing groups based on different
�shing gear, but at a more or less equal level.

Meanwhile, this study found that scarcity of �sh resources decreased catches, and decreased livelihood income created
dissatisfaction and triggered a rebellion, resulting in insecurity. In this study, con�icts among small-scale �shers on the
north coast of Java were categorized into three types: spatial con�ict, business con�ict, and livelihood con�ict (Table 1).
The indicators of con�ict intensity classi�cation into low, medium, and high scales have been analyzed based on the
indicators of each con�ict. Con�icts are categorized as low intensity when no indicators are met and high intensity when
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all indicators have been ful�lled. Based on the results of this study, the types of con�icts that occurred in the northern
coastal area of Java among small-scale �shermen, Tegal in particular can be categorized into three types of con�icts, as
seen in Table 1.

Table 1. Types of con�icts between small-scale �shers

Types of Con�ict Indicators Intensity

Spatial Con�ict Fighting over neighboring �shing grounds Medium

Business Con�ict Fuel theft 
Theft of �shing gear 
Theft of �shing equipment

High

Livelihood Con�ict Destruction of �shing gear 
Fight between �shermen and crew

High

The high dependence on marine products and the lack of other employment/income opportunities indicate the high level
of livelihood con�icts. This study categorizes the destruction of �shing gear and arguments between �shermen and
crew members as livelihood con�icts. The arguments referred to in this study often occur due to social jealousy, such as
the amount of pro�t sharing that is considered inappropriate, or the results received are not following the work done,
such as some crew members who are considered lazy in working but still get the same pro�t sharing. Meanwhile, the
destruction of �shing gear often occurs because it is considered to interfere with the �shing line between �shermen;
some nets are stuck together. These elements or indicators are closely related to their income and livelihood. In addition,
Annisa et. al., (2009) also explain that business con�icts between �shermen and non-�shermen are usually triggered by
fraud committed by traders and middlemen to payang jurung �shermen. These cheats include (1) Manipulation of
weighing from a quarter to half a kilogram; (2) The price of �sh that was originally determined by the company is now
unilaterally determined by the agents a week before; (3) Different selling prices of �sh, the selling price of �sh for
�shermen who have debts is different from �shermen who do not have debts to the same agents or pangamba'; and (4)
Deception regarding the grade of �sh. In this study, business con�ict is characterized by fraud in fuel theft and theft of
�shing gear and other �shing equipment. The cheating is intended to prevent other �shermen from going to sea or to
suffer losses so that their catches are not maximized. These fraud indicators are then referred to as business con�icts in
capture �sheries.

Meanwhile, this spatial con�ict is related to the increasingly narrow area of �shing space utilization for �shers due to the
increasing number of small-scale �shers. It's happening because of the increasing population demographically and the
low job opportunities outside the �sheries sector. The hereditary ability obtained by �shermen from their parents and
ancestors and the experience gained since childhood is �shing. Therefore, overlapping �shing areas between small-scale
�shers with boats of 3-10 GT size with various �shing gear becomes inevitable.

Generally, the potential for con�ict that occurs among small-scale �shermen on the North Coast of Java is a hidden or
latent con�ict, which is a condition of con�ict that is hidden and generally only known by several parties or even only
realized by the con�icting parties. Like what happened to small-scale �shermen on the North Coast of Java, the con�ict
among them did not cause crowds, casualties, or movements that led to large-scale con�icts. The awareness of
�shermen then realize each other because their goals are both looking for �sh for "stomach affairs", so when potential
con�icts occur, such as �shing gear, maybe what happens is just a small argument in the middle of the sea until on land
all �x their respective �shing gear because the condition of the �shing gear is equally damaged without demanding
compensation.
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Andayani, (2019) explains that con�icts generally occur between two groups of �shermen who use different �shing gear.
But the main problem does not lie in the difference in the type of �shing gear itself. In general, differences in �shing gear
that trigger con�ict contain hierarchical elements: some are superior, and some are inferior in exploiting natural
resources. In this case, even small differences in technology levels can trigger con�ict.

Furthermore, research by Kobesi et. al., (2019) explained that, in general, the potential for con�ict in the production
relations between boat owners and laborers is caused by two things, namely work relations and wages. In terms of work
relations, there are several owners of �shing �eets such as purse seines, boat charts, and �shing rods who go to sea and
double as captains so that the crew feels working under pressure and is always scolded and even cursed if they make
small mistakes when catching. Thakore (2013) explains that con�ict is a means to resolve and prevent total division,
thereby maintaining some unity. With the potential for con�ict among fellow �shermen, it is also a strengthener of
solidarity between them. After a con�ict in the form of a verbal argument on the boat, when they arrive on land, they will
work together again, such as repairing the boat or repairing damaged �shing gear.

3.3. �e forms of protest or social sanctions of �shermen on the North Coast of Java

Paterson, (2008) says that gossip is a strong form of social control. Social control is related to norms. Gossip is
considered a category of small talk, talking about people without the knowledge of the person being talked about,
whether it is positive or negative (Sommerfeld et al., 2007; Suandari et. al., 2017; Fehr and Sutter, 2019). In this study,
gossip manifests suspicion or feelings of mutual suspicion between �shermen that cannot be expressed due to lack of
evidence. Almost 50% of respondents or �shermen in Tegal said that social sanctions that often occur and are carried
out are mutual suspicion (gossiping), which is done by �shermen, crew members, and �shermen's wives (Figure 4).

Ahimsa-Putra (2012) adds that one of the social values embraced in Javanese culture, for example, is 'ngono ya ngono,
ning aja ngono' (it is still good if you act like that, but don't go that far). This value is related to the Javanese culture that
prefers to avoid extremity (ugliness) and chooses to be in the "middle", so what is referred to as extremity actually has a
limit that should not be violated.

Fig 4. Forms of protest or social sanction in con�icts between �shermen in Muarareja village, Tegal, North coast of Java
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Javanese society views harmony as a peaceful relational state without disputes or quarrels, which mainly refers to
behavior. Regardless of an individual's level of emotional peace, the absence of open con�ict and dissent indicates
relational and social harmony. Javanese social norms (i.e., good manners) dictate that one controls one's negative
emotions outwardly not to disturb others and thus disrupt social harmony. It is socially inappropriate to express negative
emotions and thus disrupt harmonious relationships. A strong social belief is that Javanese people must maintain a
pleasant life to support mutual cooperation and help. In con�ict, forgiveness is considered by many people collectively
as one important way to maintain interpersonal harmony. However, not all communities may think it is the primary way to
maintain social harmony (Kurniati et al., 2017).

For example, in the People's Republic of China, forbearance may outweigh forgiveness, i.e., suppressing emotional
expression for the sake of group harmony (Lin, 2015). Forgiveness is thought to involve two separate experiences
(Worthington et al., 2007). The decision to forgive is motivated by the desire to maintain and enhance group harmony
(Hook et al., 2012). They were controlling negative behavior toward the offender and refraining from revenge. Often this
will occur by deciding to forgive, although it may also occur through other actions (i.e., acceptance, patience and the
like).

Moreover, deciding to forgive is a behavioral intention to avoid revenge. Similarly, only in this study, many �shermen
prefer to decide the con�ict by acting resignedly or keeping quiet (Figure 4) because, based on the results of joint
re�ection, the con�ict arises because of the main basic needs (stomach needs), which are realized together. Silence and
resignation are decisions so as not to aggravate the situation, maintain the harmony that has become a Javanese culture
and to be able to continue their livelihood activities. Meanwhile, very few �shermen expressed grudges to other
�shermen. This happened because almost all �shermen in Tegal or the north coast of Java have genealogical or kinship
relationships.

Patience, maintaining behavior following Javanese manners, and giving in are the prompt resolution of con�icts.
According to traditional Javanese manners (i.e., social norms), Javanese people should behave to prevent con�ict:
restrain themselves and show politeness, not be provocative (Suseno, 1984).

3.4 Con�lict resolution

The occurrence of potential con�icts among small-scale �shers in the North Coast of Java does not cause casualties or
severe damage that triggers a larger con�ict. Con�icts that occur among small-scale �shermen can be resolved with
fellow �shermen. Suppose there is a small con�ict between �shermen such as damage to �shing gear caused by the
passing of other �shing boats. In that case, it can be resolved by paying damage or compensation between the owner of
the passing boat and the boat owner �shing in the area.

Suppose the con�ict still continues between fellow �shermen. In that case, the con�ict control method is still by means
or family level, such as bringing in �gures considered capable of mediating the con�ict. The �shermen in con�ict will be
brought together with �gures considered capable of mediating the con�ict, such as local �shermen �gures who are
considered old and can resolve disputes between these �shermen. In addition, some �gures are considered capable of
resolving disputes among �shermen, such as local religious leaders and rich �shermen whose opinions are listened to.
The following is a scheme of actors involved in con�ict resolution among small-scale �shermen on the North Coast of
Java.
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Fig 5. Actors involved in con�ict resolution

Simanjuntak et. al. (2019) explains that competition between fellow �shermen is certain to occur, even between fellow
crew members on the same boat; there are also frequent con�icts. Con�icts usually occur because one crew member
feels that the other is lazy in working, sharing their results equally. However, this usually does not last long. If the con�ict
continues between the crew members, the skipper will immediately break up the con�ict between them. The skipper will
be the mediator between them; usually, the skipper will give advice �rst, but if it is not listened to, the skipper will dismiss
the crew.

Andayani, (2019) mentioned that most Javanese people are likelier to use avoidance or non-confrontation strategies
when resolving con�icts with friends. They choose not to talk to each other, keep quiet and keep their distance for a
while. It is called “jothakan” or “meneng-menengan” in Javanese terms. “Jothakan” as a con�ict resolution occurs
because Javanese culture does not provide space for individuals to express con�ict openly, all behavior must be
regulated to maintain harmony in social relations. Meanwhile, for potential con�icts that occur between small-scale
�shermen on the north coast of Java, they will usually agree to make peace. Then the dispute can be resolved by
forgetting or good two-way communication between �shermen in con�ict.

4. Discussion
Con�ict is related to people's personal and collective social relationships and has a certain level of antagonism, tension,
or negative feelings. Satria (2009) divides con�ict into six types of con�ict: class, management, resource management,
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production method/tool, environmental, business, and primordial.

Based on the con�ict group formation Kinseng et. al., (2014) divides con�icts among �shermen (internal con�icts) into
three categories, namely: 1) class con�ict is a con�ict that occurs between different classes of �shermen, for example,
between laborers and owners or between small �shermen and large-capitalist �shermen. 2) Identity con�ict is a con�ict
that occurs between �shermen groups based on primordial identities such as ethnicity and regional origin or often
known as local versus migrant. In addition, religion can also be used as the basis forcefor this primordial con�ict group,
and the last is 3) �shing gear con�ict is a con�ict between �shing groups based on different �shing gear, but at a more
or less equal level. While Fisher et al., (2000) state that con�icts can occur due to territorial struggles (spatial con�ict),
differences in resource utilization (orientation con�ict), and con�icts between traditional and modern �shermen (class
con�ict).

Rochani, (2005) stated that historically, Tegal city was famous for its strong �shermen since the Dutch colonial era.
Tegal was also known as a port and trade center that was visited by many sailors from various regions in the archipelago
to foreign countries. The social life of a typical coastal community is colored by cultural acculturation between
immigrants and residents, making Tegal one of the trading cities in northern Java that is always dynamic. Data from the
BPS (2018) stated that the number of �shermen in Tegal City reached 12,589 people, consisting of 630 juragan or ship
owners, �shing laborers or crew members as many as 11,959, the number of ships as many as 955 units, with seven
types of �shing gear namely purse seine, gill net, arad net, cantrang, beach seine, and trap (bubu) (Sudarmo, 2016).

Simanjuntak, et. al., (2019) states that the potential con�ict often faced by small-scale �shermen is arguing with other
�shermen, both small and large �shermen. For fellow small-scale �shermen, con�icts are usually triggered by the
problem of the same �shing area zone between �shermen, which causes �shermen's income in the same �shing area
zone to decrease.

Based on the results of the research conducted, information was obtained regarding the chronology of con�ict between
small-scale �shers in Tegal, one of which was characterized by high competition between �shers and the narrowness of
the �shing area in the �shing operation area due to the density of �shers which was also a source of exposure. This then
had an impact on the pattern of exploitation, which then triggered con�icts between �shermen due to frequent friction
between �shermen. Con�icts that are often experienced are due to hooking between �shing gear, and this �shing gear
hooking occurs when �shermen go to sea and then prepare to throw the �shing gear in the form of arad nets not long
after passing other �shing boats over the net so that the net is hooked to the ship. The snag damages the �shing gear
that is already in the area and often causes con�ict between them.

The next potential trigger for con�ict is the theft of �shing gear both in the middle of the sea and on land is still prone to
theft because of the high competition between �shermen. Many �shermen are cunning by stealing �shing gear. Arad
�shermen are suspected of stealing bubu often when bubu �shermen usually stock 1500 bubu in the middle of the sea,
then the bubu stocked is missing 100-200 bubu. Theft of �shing gear also often occurs between fellow small �shermen
in Muarareja, this is usually due to jealousy of the catches of one �sherman with another and there is already a basis for
potential small con�icts between them. The theft of �shing gear results in �shermen not being able to go to sea,
especially since �shing gear is so expensive that �shermen cannot immediately buy it on that day, thus making
�shermen not go to sea. The theft or taking of �shing gear is suspected to be often carried out by arad net �shermen.

In addition, theft of diesel fuel also often occurs at night, which has been prepared on the boat the next day only found
empty diligent, resulting in �shermen not being able to go to sea that day. Fuel theft like this has often occurred between
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fellow �shermen. Fishermen can only surrender when the diesel fuel they use to go to sea in the morning is lost.
However, the �shermen cannot judge the culprit due to insu�cient evidence. So, it only leads to suspicion. Fishermen
can only surmise who stole their fuel, but this only reaches the stage of suspicion because there is no evidence at all
obtained.

Geographically, Muarareja Village is located adjacent to Tegalsari Village, which is a large-scale �sheries center, namely
the center of the operation of trawl boats, which is related to the area of the ship's entrance and exit, which is still often
marked by con�icts between �shermen due to the density of trawl boats often covering the exit of �shing boats. In
addition, the limited �shing area is also a trigger for con�ict between �shermen. Small �shermen can usually only �sh as
far as 12 miles from the shore, so all small �shermen will gather in the same place. It also triggers con�icts because one
�sherman feels that another �sherman has taken his catch. However, this only happens when there is an argument
between �shermen and not a big �ght. Some �shermen believe and do not mind the �shing areas close to each other
because they consider that sustenance has been arranged, so there is no need to worry because everyday sustenance
must be there if they remain diligent in going to sea.

Every society has values of activities that are often passed down from generation to generation, become habits, and
become a culture, namely tradition, as a representation of culture. Culture is displayed as a guideline where people
believe in the truth (Saddhono, 2018; Wahyudi & Sigit, 2011). As a manifestation of culture, tradition is a moment to
express, maintain, and celebrate community bonds (Hardwick, 2017). Javanese people in their daily lives are strongly
in�uenced by beliefs, concepts of cultural values and norms that appear in their minds. These values are traditions and
actions transmitted orally (tutur tinular) from generation to generation (Griyanti et. al.,, 2018; Fauzi et. al.,, 2019).

Social control in rural areas places the greatest emphasis on conformity with social values. The strongest sanctions or
forms of protest in rural areas, especially in Java, are gossip and ostracism. Relatives and relatives have less power than
neighbors in exercising social control. The same is true for con�ict. Interpersonal con�ict, anger, and aggression are
suppressed or avoided in Javanese society. Javanese culture �nds it di�cult to express dissent. Therefore, when there is
direct criticism, anger, and resentment are rarely expressed. The main way when there is interpersonal con�ict is to not
talk to each other (satru) (Ahimsa-Putra, 2012).

Dahrendorf (1973) explains that "Every society experiences at every moment social con�ict; social con�ict is ubiquitous",
coastal communities and small islands are indeed by no means peaceful, serene, and harmonious communities without
con�ict. Therefore, this paper discusses social con�icts in coastal communities and small islands.

Dahrendorf (1973) further states that in every association characterized by con�ict, tension exists between those who
participate in the power structure and those subject to that structure. There are quasi-groups and interest groups. The
interests Dahrendorf refers to may be manifest or latent. Latent interests are potential behaviors determined for a person
because he occupies a certain role but is still not realized. So a person can be a class member with no power, but they
may not realize it as a group.

Annisa et. al., (2009) explain that con�ict is a phenomenon that has existed for a long time, even before the era of
regional autonomy, especially con�ict over �sheries. The freedom to exploit �sheries resources is a consequence of the
open-access nature of ownership, so it is not uncommon for its utilization to cause problems due to differences in
interests. Based on this, managing �sheries resources that can reduce and prevent con�ict is necessary as a con�ict
management effort.
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4.1 Cause and E�fect Chain of Food Security and Con�lict Among Small Scale Fishers on North
Coast of Java

Food security is a fairly simple concept, but if examined more closely, this concept will reveal several layers of
complexity. The o�cially adopted de�nition of food security (since the 1996 World Food Summit) says that food security
occurs when all people, at all times, have physical and economic access to su�cient safe and nutritious food that meets
their food needs and food preferences for a certain period can live an active and healthy life.

Is food insecurity a cause of con�ict?. According to Helland & Sørbø (2014)it is yes: ‘Food insecurity, especially when
caused by higher food prices, increases the risk of democratic failure, civil con�ict, protests, riots, and communal
con�ict’. Vulnerability can trigger or sustain con�ict in a variety of ways; sudden increases in food prices can trigger
con�ict; competition for food production resources can lead to recurring con�icts; Inequalities that affect food security
can exacerbate grievances and build momentum toward con�ict. Communal con�icts tend to cluster in areas where
natural resources are limited. As is the case among small-scale �shermen on the North Coast of Java, where the
condition of �sh stocks in the Java Sea has been identi�ed as experiencing over�shing, con�icts over catches, especially
during the lean season, will always arise. In general, the potential for con�ict that occurs among small-scale �shermen
on the North Coast of Java is hidden con�ict or what is often called latent con�ict, namely a condition of con�ict that is
hidden in nature and is generally only known by a few parties or even only realized by the parties in con�ict. Just like
what happened to small-scale �shermen on the North coast of Java, the con�icts that occurred between them did not
cause crowds, casualties, or movements that led to large-scale con�icts. Awareness from �shermen who then become
aware of each other because their goal is to catch �sh for "stomach matters", so when a potential con�ict occurs, such
as getting caught in �shing gear, maybe it's just a small argument in the middle of the sea and on land, everyone �xes
their respective �shing gear. because the condition of the �shing gear was equally damaged without demanding
compensation.

Con�icts that occur due to competition between �shermen in obtaining catches accompanied by environmental
degradation threaten livelihoods and food security. However, this impact is quite complex. Therefore, regions that are
most vulnerable to the pressures/dangers of environmental degradation and food security tend to experience more
con�ict. Although con�ict and livelihoods are interrelated, livelihood vulnerability is closely related and is also
determined by policies, institutions, and socio-economic processes that in�uence their access to the means of
production, power relations between different livelihood groups and their production systems. So, even though many
livelihood con�icts occur which have an impact on the food security experienced by �shermen on the north coast of
Java, there is still a way out of the cycle of con�ict.

According to FAO (2019)there are four important dimensions of food security that must exist, including 1) Food
availability, which is determined by the level of food production, reserve stocks, and clean trade; 2) Access to food, which
concerns the ability of individuals and households to obtain su�cient food. This is often related to household income,
food markets, and prices; 3) Food utilization, which concerns the ability of individuals and households to maintain
healthy eating patterns that meet human needs in terms of nutrition, including energy and micronutrients; 4) Stability,
which concerns the stable existence of the three dimensions mentioned above over a long period.

To ful�ll the need for food, �shermen on the north coast of Java optimizing the potential of local resources is the right
step to achieve food independence and security in an area. Naturally, �shing households have the ability/capacity to
adapt to developing ecological, social, economic and technological dynamics. In an effort to increase this adaptive
capacity, institutional social networks will naturally be built in the form of joint business groups (KUB) or cooperatives.
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So, in this case, it can be said that �shermen on the north coast of Java still have the ability/capability to use food and
have su�cient access. When �shermen have con�icts, this can prevent �shermen from �nding their daily needs, but they
still look for ways to ful�ll their daily needs. Working as a �sherman is the only way of survival that �shermen can do
because they do not have other skills in other �elds. Some �shermen, outside of their activities as �shermen, become
construction workers, but not all �shermen can do this, so that when a con�ict occurs between them, the �shermen will
look for a solution to the problem individually or in groups. So that in order to ful�ll their daily needs, �shermen in con�ict
continue to work at sea. Suadi et al.(2022)also stated that the adaptation strategy for small-scale �shermen in the midst
of pressure is to intensify �shing over longer distances or for longer periods of time.

Quoting the results of research by Nissa et al (2019) which states that with the reorganization of roles on a small-scale
�shing household scale, there is a good social safety net such as bonds of trust between neighbors providing easy
access to borrowing money and food. Saksono et al.(2023)say that small-scale �shermen will utilize various
technologies and develop group organizations to avoid problems such as territorial disputes. Fishermen also do this by
asking for support and subsidies and actively participating in religious activities. Local regulations or customary norms
that prohibit �shing on certain days are said to help increase �sh stocks, so that sea alms becomes a safety net for
�shing communities. Apart from that, government policies and related institutions that play a role in the form of
providing subsidies and food assistance for small-scale �shing households, one of which is through the Family Hope
Program during or before con�icts between �shermen can maintain the survival and sustainability of small-scale
�shermen's livelihoods. Onyenekwe et al., (2022)added that access to social capital and opportunities for livelihood
diversi�cation can encourage increased income, increasing household capacity to achieve food security status in the
face of recurring instability. It is known that small-scale �shing households with a large number of family members and
children of productive age also contribute to increasing family income, such as the children of small-scale �shermen
who work as crew members on 100GT cantrang vessels operating in the Java Sea, actually has a greater incomethan his
father (Nissa et al, 2019; Nissa’ et al., 2023). So it can be said that adaptive capacity plays an important role in driving
progress towards food security. Thus, small-scale �shing households in the North of Java Island can also be said to still
be able to have high food security even though they often face con�icts between �shermen in the �shing process and
�ghting over the catch. This is because the adaptability and level of resilience possessed by small-scale �shing
households on the north coast of Java is high. Collaboration that is built is related to factors of mutual trust, norms and
networks which constitute social capital carried out by individuals. Mustofa (2012)explains that mutual trust is re�ected
in how one individual and another have an agreement to trust other people. This trust does not come by itself, but there
are norm or value factors that exist between individuals to be able to trust each other.

The resilience of livelihood diversi�cation is an aspect of seafood security that refers to �sheries, such as artisanal
�sheries, which are de�ned as household �shing that uses relatively little capital and energy with relatively small (if any)
�shing vessels that catch �sh near the coast mainly to sell their catch to the national domestic market (WIOFish 2019).
These �shermen also often eat part of their catch, creating a midpoint between direct and indirect food security. Access
to food and income for subsistence is the reason why small-scale �sheries provide food security and livelihoods for
many communities (Hardy et al., 2017). National data in many countries often only record primary employment and
therefore may misrepresent the nature of communities dependent on �shing for livelihoods (Keskinen et al., 2007).
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5. Conclusion
Small-scale �shing communities in the northern coast of Java, especially in the case of Muarareja village, Tegal are
generally �shermen with boats under 10GT with �shing gear dominated by mini trawlers and bubu traps. Capture
�sheries in Muarareja village,Tegal have long been indicated over�shing; therefore, social con�icts in their livelihoods are
often found. Livelihood con�icts dominate con�icts that occur among small-scale �shermen. Forms of con�ict that
small-scale �shermen often carry out are vandalism and petty theft, with protests or sanctions given only silenced.
Fishermen on the north coast of Java still uphold the Javanese cultural culture that prefers to live in peace and harmony.
Therefore, con�ict resolution among small-scale �shermen is usually completed only by silence and forgotten over time,
even though there is a grudge held or some �shermen choose to resolve with deliberations mediated through religious
leaders, rich �shermen (upper layer), and wise old �shermen. The con�ict dynamics among small-scale �shermen do not
surface much because there are more latent con�icts. Small-scale �shing households in the North of Java Island can
also be said to still be able to have high food security even though they often face con�icts between �shermen in the
�shing process and �ghting over the catch. This is because the adaptability and level of resilience possessed by small-
scale �shing households on the north coast of Java is high. Collaboration that is built is related to factors of mutual
trust, norms and networks which constitute social capital carried out by individual �shers. Therefore, a deeper study is
needed on the dynamics of con�icts among small-scale �shermen, which can be an insight for the local government to
rearrange regulations related to regulating the number of catches in over�shing areas and providing alternative side job
opportunities for these small-scale �shermen.
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